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ABSTRACT- Because of the appearance of PC innovation Image segmentation strategies
have turned out to be progressively essential in a wide assortment of uses. Image division is a
great subject in the field of Image segmentation furthermore is a hotspot and center of Image
preparing methods. A few broadly useful calculations and methods have been produced for
Image division. Since there is no broad answer for the Image division issue, these strategies
regularly must be joined with space information keeping in mind the end goal to viably tackle a
Image division issue for an issue area. This overview clarifies a few strategies for Image
division.
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1. INTRODUCTION
Term division is about part the entire

Image into portions. If there should arise an
occurrence of Image investigation, Image
preparing one of the pivotal strides is division
of Image. Division of Image worry about
isolating whole Image in sub parts that might
be comparative or unique regarding
highlights. Yield of Image division has
outcome on examination of Image, further
segmentation of Image. Examination of Image
contains portrayal of article and protest
representation, estimation of highlight.
Subsequently portrayal, range of interest’s
representation in the Image, depiction has
critical occupation in division of Image.

1.1 DEPENDING ON IMAGE
SEGMENTATION

Strategies [2], it may be gathered in 2
sorts, Characterization and Comparison.
Characterization may be dealt with as intra-
system methodology where as comparison
Strategy may be dealt with as between
procedure. Contingent upon various systems,
image segmentation strategies are categorized
as Discontinuities Detection and Similarities
Detection, relying upon two image properties.
Discontinuities Detection: The finding of edge
needs this property this contains image
segmentation calculation. Image power is
changed and split the image. Detection of
edge is only segmentation by finding pixels on
limit region. The edge may be shown by limit
including bordering components of an image.
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2. LITRETURE SURVEY

[Hedley and Yan, 1992] has been
connected effectively the Sobel administrator
to each of the three planes in the RGB space
and the inclinations were summed to get the
resultant edges. They figure the Sobel
administrator on each of the three RGB planes
and afterward aggregate the outcomes. For
their guide preparing application where
colorsand items are very much characterized,
this is by all accounts a satisfactory strategy
for edge detection. Be that as it may, for more
unpredictable shading images where it is
important to catch better the correlation
between the planes, this methodology would
likely be insufficient. [Carron et. al., 1994]
connected the Sobel administrator to every
component of the HSI space and the
individual results were joined utilizing an
exchange off parameter amongst shade and
power. An intriguing component of this
exchange off parameter was its reliance on the
level saturation. The consequences of this
combination are not convincing given the test
images utilized (there are only minor contrasts
between results where tone information is
utilized when contrasted with those where it is
most certainly not). Shading image scenes
containing shadows may have given a superior
indication of the abilities of consolidating the
information contained inside the individual
HSI planes. [Liu and Yang, 1994] proposed
image segmentation classification procedures
for image segmentation into three classes:
histogram-based, neighborhood-based, and
physically-based techniques. Histogram-based
methods for the most part play out some kind
of grouping in a pre-characterized estimation
space, e.g. RGB. The implementation
proposed by neighborhood-based methods
considers little nearby neighborhoods in an
image and utilize this information to help in
decision-production. The [Deng and
Majunath, 1999] paper proposes a method that
falls generally into this class. The third kind of
methodologies uses the genuine material
science of light and the shading formation
procedure to perform segmentation, and the

strategy proposed by [Healey et.al., 1992] in is
a prime illustration. For shading images,
various methodologies have been proposed
from segmentation singular planes [Carron et.
al., 1994] to genuine vector-based
methodologies [Dony and Haykin, 1999]. The
computational heap of processing edges on
individual planes can be much littler than that
of registering edges on the shading vector. In
any case, this is by all accounts an exchange
off amongst velocity and calculation
execution. The vector-based methodologies
misuse the correlation between the shading
planes substantially more successfully than the
computation on singl planes. This is the
reason most scientists have concentrated on
the vector-based approaches.[Zhiguang et.al.,
2008] find that image segmentation technique
taking into account diagram hypothesis is
chiefly utilized for gray images, and
thresholding of segmentation must be
predefined. So they proposed the unsupervised
segmentation for shading image in light of
diagram hypothesis. Consolidating with
entropy in information hypothesis, they
propose an unsupervised strategy for shading
image segmentation in view of Minimum
Spanning Tree (MST). The image is mapped
into a weighted undirected chart, the pixels are
considered to be as hubs, the best thresholding
is obtained by target function of greatest
weighted entropy to acknowledge un
supervised segmentation. Their investigation
comes about demonstrate that the new
calculation guarantees the shading image
segmentation superb aggravation attenuation
execution and better distinguishableness. [Yi-
hua et.al., 2009] discover the downsides in
existing work as: dark level image is not
reasonable for images with complex object,
edge based strategy is not appropriate for
obscured images and images with complex
edges is not continent to process, snake based
plan revered to effect of beginning bend,
watershed segmentation some of the time lead
to over segmentation issue, and diagram cut
hypothesis consider the worldwide dim level
and space information which make the image
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segmentation issue. So [Yi-hua et.al., 2009]
proposed a novel image segmentation
technique in light of arbitrary walk model. As
a matter of first importance, they down-testing
the first vast image to the little image which
can be unraveled speedier, then the little
image segmentation prompts inadequate direct
equations of much minor scale. Subsequent to
accepting the solution, the likelihood results
will be up-examining to the upper layer, and
after that resolve the inadequate direct
equations in this layer; rehashing this up-
testing process until to the top layer which is
the source image. Portion the last likelihood
image with a known edge. They test their
calculation on two common images and
contrast the segmentation comes about and
that from the first arbitrary walk calculation
system. The segmentation comes about
demonstrate that their outcomes are much
better.[Maire et.al., 2009] explored two crucial
issues in PC vision: contour detection and
image segmentation. They introduced new
best in class calculations systems for both of
these errands. Proposed segmentation
calculation consists of non specific hardware
for changing the yield of any contour
identifier into a progressive region tree. In this
way, they lessen the issue of image
segmentation to that of contour detection.
Their methodology is to contour detection
couples multi-scale neighborhood brilliance,
shading, and surface prompts to an intense
globalization structure utilizing unearthly
grouping. This methodology outperforms
existing image segmentation calculations on
measures of both limit and section quality.
These various leveled segmentations can
optionally be further refined by client
indicated annotations. While the greater part
of this work centers on processing static
images. [Yuan and Chen, 2009] builds up an
image segmentation strategy in light of the
altered edge-taking after plan where
distinctive edges are consequently decided by
with shifted contents in a photo, in this
manner yielding appropriate segmentation
brings about various territories. They

proposed a strong segmentation strategy that
is appropriate for nonspecific image like
design. The procedures depend on the various
leveled segmentation under quad-tree
decomposition [Chen et. al., 2007], an image
is enough decayed into numerous squares and
sub-obstructs as per the image contents.
Simulation comes about demonstrate that the
proposed technique is better than the
conventional strategies to some level. Because
of keeping away from human impedances and
diminishing working time, the proposed
technique is more vigorous and reasonable to
different image and video applications than
the conventional segmentation strategies.
[Maia and Hongpeng, 2010] to enhance the
execution of image segmentation explored
another image segmentation procedures in
light of Gray Graph Cut which incorporates
dim hypothesis and diagram cut hypothesis
techniques. In the strategies, first the image is
taken as a weighted undirected chart. After
then, the relationships of grey levels and
locations in nearby regions are examined by
means of dim relational investigation, a dim
weighted lattice is recognized, in light of
which a dim partition function is determined.
After, the image is changed to binarized with
the dim level that corresponds to the base
estimation of the dim board function.
Investigational comes about on visible light
image and SAR image demonstrate that the
proposed procedure, being ideal to some
current methods like Otsu and Normalized Cut
and so forth., not just that can portion the
images with clear difference among targets
and foundations, additionally keep down
image clamor effectively.[Harrabi and Braiek,
2012] introduced another shading image
segmentation system, in view of multilevel
edge and information fusion strategies which
go for consolidating diverse information
sources related to the same color image so as
to build the information quality and to get a
more dependable and accurate segmentation
impact. The anticipated segmentation
methodology is conceptually diverse and
investigates a novel procedure. Indeed, in its
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place of considering only one image for each
application, the strategy consists in
consolidating numerous realizations of the
indistinguishable image, together, in sort to
build the information quality and to get a best
divided image. They utilized an ideal multi-
level thresholding depends on the two-phase
Otsu optimization approach and The notion of
mass functions, in the Dempster-Shafer (DS)
proof hypothesis innovation, is connected to
the Gaussian distribution, and the last
segmentation is acknowledged, on an info
image, that is communicated in various
shading spaces. A noteworthy issue in the
field of shading image segmentation region,
and even image segmentation in all inclusive,
has been what is known as 'the absence of
ground truth' [Deng and Majunath, 1999]. Up
to as of late with the creation of the
segmentation dataset, every paper's creators
would utilize totally diverse images to test
their algorithms and methods. Along these
lines, it was to a great degree hard to judge the
class of a segmentation technique or even to
contrast it and its companions. The decision of
dataset is an initial phase in attempting to
make a kind of standard for segmentation
result. However, segmentation is stationary an
extremely subjective assignment in nature and
even inside the dataset, there are various
errors. Therefore, comparisons of calculations
have been traditionally quite dangerous
errand. In this review, as an option of
attempting to draw direct comparisons
between calculations, they endeavored to drill
down the comparison between programmed
thresholding utilizing quad-tree decomposition
and shading image segmentation in view of
various shading models strategies.

3. DIFFERENT SEGMENTATION
METHODS

Techniques for Image segmentation
can be for the most part classified in 2 sorts;
Local segmentation and Global segmentation.
Worldwide segmentation is connected with
segmentation of whole image. Regularly it is
connected with fragment parts involving

nearly colossal number of pixels [6], [7].This
constructs evaluated estimations of parameter
for worldwide portion parts mainly hearty.
Segmentation of an image could be and come
closer from 3 different perspective. To be
specific Region approach, Boundary
approach, Edge approach. At the point when
any pixel fits in item, that pixel speaks to one
value else speaks to zero quality.
Segmentation [4], [14] is the working in limit
between image investigation and low level
image preparing. Ensuing to the entire
segmentation, pixel [6], [7] feel right to an
item. Basic methods[4] exercise a few
information about the structure of the region
for segmentation. Stochastic strategies are
connected on detached pixels without
knowing or remembering any auxiliary
learning of territory. Factual examination is
one of the strategies on which stochastic
strategy [4] depends. Half breed technique [4]
involves those strategies which have the
components of basic and in addition stochastic
strategies.

3.1 EDGE DETECTION TECHNIQUES
Image's force truths basically give

inadequate, provisional information with
respect to position of edges. Edge detection
technique [6] is finding pixel on the region
limit. Edge detection technique tries to decide
image segmentation by seeing the pixels or
edges between different regions that have
brisk transition in force are removed [2], [15]
and coupled to make shut limits of item. The
result is a parallel image [5]. One reason for
uncertainly shows up from the nearness of
commotion set up in imaging process and
subsequently in transmission, procedure of
inspecting. Another reason for uncertainly
appears from the way that any estimation bit
of gear is faulty and their results are simply
incomplete inspection. It says that techniques
for edge detection ar e typically badly
represented, that is they are under-constrained
and subsequently won't not have single
solutions. The least difficult way to deal with
discover edges in image is to look for
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locations in a mage where power adjusts
rapidly utilizing one of two conditions;
Location s at which most punctual force
subsidiary greater in greatness than some
limit, Locations at which second power
subordinate has a zero intersection. Edge
detection [13] technique is one of auxiliary
strategy for the image segmentation strategy.

3.2 THRESHOLDTECHNIQUE
One least demanding development of

image segmentation is relies on estimations of
pixels. The method is to utilize segmentation
relies on upon thresholding which may assist
to straightforward region developing strides.
Thresholding algorithms could be chosen
physically according to a development
comprehension or mechanically by image
information. Thresholding calculations
additionally isolated to region based, edge
based, or hybrid. Edge based calculations are
connected with edge data. The item
composition could be represented by edge
focuses. General edge detection calculations
like Laplacian edge identifier, vigilant edge
finder could be arranged to this kind of
regions. These calculations are used to inquiry
edge pixels while evacuating impact of
clamor. Thresholding is elderly, direct, all
around acknowledged strategy for
segmentation of image [16]. Segmentation of
image by thresholding is a n simple however
ordering approach for image segmentation
including light questions on desolate
surroundings [2]. Thresholding strategy is
relies on image space ranges that is on image
attributes [1]. Action thresholding makes an
interpretation of multilevel image into a
twofold one that is, it chooses a proper edge T,
to part pixels of an image in various ranges
then confines protests separated from
foundation.

3.3 REGION SEGMENTATION
TECHNIQUES

R demonstrates region of image and is
expressed as a connected homogenous subset
of an image as for some criterion like texture

or dim level. Image regions are group of
connected pixels with practically equivalent to
belongings. In this approach, each pixel is
doled out to particular zone or an item. As
assessed with edge detection procedure,
region subordinate segmentation calculations
are qui te easy and more unaffected with
commotion [1], [18]. Edge subordinate
procedures separate an image taking into
account fast alterations in force close edges
while region based systems; partition an
image in regions that are similar to as per an
arrangement of pre - indicated criteria [5], [8].
In segmentation that relies on upon regions,
pixels corresponding to protest are collected
together and checked. Region based
segmentation in addition requires the
utilization of appropriate thresholding
strategies. The key standards are v alue
resemblance which contains change in dim
quality, contrasts in dim worth and spatial
vicinity which includes Euclidean separation,
region conservativeness.

3.4 CLUSTERING TECHNIQUES
In image preparing grouping is a

pivotal errand. Bunching [11], [12] is an
unsupervised learning work, at which there are
necessities to see a limited arrangement of
classifications called as groups to perceive
pixels [13]. No preparation stages are utilized
as a part of Clustering; rather prepare
themselves by me ans of existing information.
Grouping is for the most part used when
classes are recognized in earlier. A
correspondence criterion is portrayed between
pixels [2], a while later closely resembling
pixels are gathered by and large to make
bunches. Pixels gathered into bunches is relies
on the law of abusing the intra class
resemblance and shortening the bury class
similarity. Bunching strategy tries to utilize
the affiliation among examples of the set by
life form the examples in bunches or
gatherings so that example inside a group are
additional closely resembling each different as
contrast with examples of assorted bunch.
Bunching result quality depends on
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comparability measure used by technique and
its execution. Unrivaled bunching procedure
[20] will make top quality groups with high
intra class resemblance and low bury - class
similarity. The incredibleness of a grouping
system is likewise pondered by its ability to
find. Bunching is only categorization of
articles in gatherings as indicated by specific
belongings of these items.

3.5 ARTIFICIAL NEURAL NETWORK
TECHNIQUES

The Neural Network is only fake
demonstration of human cerebrum this
endeavors to impersonate its learning method.
Fake Neural Network [24], [25] much of the
time known as a neural system or simply
neural net. A la mode, neural nets are
extensively used to answer the emergency of
image segmentation in restorative stream. It is
subject to life imitation, especially learning
procedure of human brains, involves an
immense number of parallel hubs. Each hub

could do some central registering. Learning
procedure could be refined through moving
the hub connections and weights of
connection [26]. Its major noteworthy
advantage is not subject to the function called
as likelihood thickness distribution function. It
could likewise confirms segmentation
consequences at whatever point the
information difference from the standard
condition. Neural net could likewise lessen the
master intervention necessities while doing
procedure of image segmentation. This
emergency is common in heaps of age
segmentation strategies. At first, the issue of
image segmentation is changed into vitality
minimization or classification issues,
Afterwards issues are addressed relying upon
neural system in this strategy. The neural net
was prepared with set of preparing test with
intend to choose the connection between the
hubs and weights between the hubs. After that
with prepared neural system new images were
divided.

4. SEGMENTATION METHODS AND ITS LIMITATIONS
Authors Name of

Segmentation
Method

Description of
Method

Benefits of
Method

Limitations of
Method

W. X. Kang et.al.
Zhang et.al.
Rastgarpour M. et.al.
Jesmin F. Khan et.al.
V. K. Dehariya et.al.
Nikhil R Pal et.al.

Edge Detection
Method

Depends on
discontinuity
detection, generally
aims to
situate points with
less or
more rapid gray
level
changes.

- Approach by
which
human perceives
objects.
- Job fine for
images
possessing
excellent
region disparity.

- Not good with images
where  edges are
unclearly defined

- Not good with images
having moreover edges
-It’s not minor work to
create a boundary or

Closed curve.
-Tiny noise resistant as

compare to other
Methods.

W. X. Kang et.al.
Zhang et.al.
V. K. Dehariya et.al.
Nikhil R Pal et.al.
Y. Zhang et.al.
T. Lindeberg et.al.

Thresholding
Method

Wants that the
image has a
various peaks, each
one
correspond to a
region.

- Not requires
former
Image
knowledge.
-Minimum
complexity
Of computation.

-Not good for image
With no any clear peaks.

-Not good for image
With wide, plane valleys.

-Not believes spatial
facts, therefore no

guarantee of contiguous
Segmented regions.

W. X. Kang et.al.
Zhang et.al.
D.L. Pham et.al.
Rastgarpour M. et.al.
H. G. Kaganami et.al.
H. Zhang et.al.
S. Lakare et.al.

Region Dependent
Method

Assembles pixels in
Uniform regions.
Counting
region growing,
splitting,
merging or their
Permutation.

- Do well if
region
homogeneity
norm is
Painless to
define.
- Extra noise

-Pretty pricey regarding
memory, computational

Time.
-Region growing relies
on seed region selection
and sequence by which

regions, pixels are
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resistant
as compare to
Edge
Detection
method.

Inspected.
-Output segments by

region splitting emerge
too square because of

splitting format.
Zhang et.al.
Yang Yang et.al.
J. Senthilnath et.al.
V. K. Dehariya et.al.
R.Xu et.al.
F .Z. Kettaf et.al.
S. Naz et.al.
S.Tatiraju et.al.

Fuzzy Method Use fuzzy operators,
mathematics,
properties and
inference rules, give
a
mode to handle the
uncertainty inherent
in a
range of troubles
because of
ambiguity instead
randomness.

-fuzzy
membership
function could be
utilized to show
the
degree of few
properties or
linguistic
phrase, fuzzy If-
Than
rules could be
utilized
to do approximate
inference.

-fuzzy membership
determination isn’t

minor job.
- Calculation occupied in
fuzzy approaches could

be intensive.

T.F. Wang et.al.
Y.L.Huang et.al.
T.Kohonen

Neural Network
Method

to do clustering
,classification or
neural net are used.

-Doesn’t require
writing tedious
programs.
- Could entirely
exploit
the parallel nature
of
neural net.

-Extended Training
period.

-Initialization might
affect the outcome.

-Extra training must be
kept away.

CONCLUSION
In this review paper different strategies

for image segmentation are examined, the
outline of various segmentation procedures
connected on computerized image
segmentation is edified in a matter of seconds.
The paper additionally assesses assortment of
examination systems connected on image
segmentation. These methods are most
noteworthy for example detection and
recognition by utilizing edges, images, focuses
and so on. Strategies of image segmentation
expressed in this review paper are used in
various present day machines for face
identification, image identification, design
recognition and so on. Image segmentation
has a promising and requesting open door as
the all inclusive segmentation calculation and
has turned into the focal point of attention of
momentum exploration.

REFERENCES
[1]. W. X. Kang, Q. Q. Yang, R. R. Liang,
“The Comparative Research on Image
Segmentation Algorithms”, IEEE Conference
on ETCS, pp. 703-707, 2009.

[2]. Zhang, Y. J, An Overview of Image and
Video Segmentation in the last 40 years,
Proceedings of the 6th
International Symposium on Signal
Processing and Its Applications, pp. 144-151,
2001.
[3]. D.L. Pham, Ch. Xu and J.L. Princo, ―a
survey on current methods in medical image
segmentation Annual Review of Biomedical
Engineering, vol. 2, 2000.
[4]. Wahba Marian, An Automated Modified
Region Growing Technique for Prostate
Segmentation in Trans-Rectal Ultrasound
Images, Master’s Thesis, Department of
Electrical and Computer Engineering,
University of Waterloo, Waterloo, Ontario,
Canada, 2008.
[5]. Rastgarpour M., and Shanbehzadeh J.,
Application of AI Techniques in Medical
Image Segmentation and Novel
Categorization of Available Methods and
Tools, Proceedings of the International
MultiConference of Engineers and Computer
Scientists 2011 Vol I, IMECS 2011, March
16-18, 2011, Hong Kong.
[6]. Jesmin F. Khan, Sharif M. A. Bhuiyan,
and Reza R. Adhami,” Image Segmentation



IJRSET NOVEMBER 2015 Volume 2, Issue 12 Pages: 54-62
and Shape Analysis for Road-Sign Detection”,
IEEE TRANSACTIONS ON INTELLIGENT
TRANSPORTATION SYSTEMS, VOL. 12,
NO. 1, MARCH 2011.
[7]. Andrew Janowczyk, Sharat Chandran,
Rajendra Singh, Dimitra Sasaroli, George
Coukos, Michael D. Feldman, and Anant
Madabhushi,” High-Throughput Biomarker
Segmentation on Ovarian Cancer Tissue
Microarrays via Hierarchical Normalized
Cuts”, IEEE TRANSACTIONS ON
BIOMEDICAL ENGINEERING, VOL. 59,
NO. 5, MAY 2012.
[8]. H. G. Kaganami, Z. Beij, “Region Based
Detection versus Edge Detection”, IEEE
Transactions on Intelligent information hiding
and multimedia signal processing, pp. 1217-
1221, 2009.
[9]. Panagiotis Sidiropoulos, Vasileios
Mezaris, Ioannis (Yiannis) Kompatsiaris and
Josef Kittler,” Differential Edit Distance: A
Metric for Scene Segmentation Evaluation”,
IEEE TRANSACTIONS ON CIRCUITS
AND SYSTEMS FOR VIDEO
TECHNOLOGY, VOL. 22, NO. 6, JUNE
2012.
[10]. Alasdair McAndraw, School of
Computer Science and Mathematics Victoria
University of Technology“An Introduction To
digital Image Processing with MATLAB”,
September 2004.
[11]. Yang Yang, Yi Yang, Heng Tao Shen,
Yanchun Zhang, Xiaoyong Du, Xiaofang
Zhou,” Discriminative Nonnegative Spectral
Clustering with Out-of-Sample Extension”,
Digital Object Identifier
10.1109/TKDE.2012.118 1041-
4347/12/$31.00 © 2012 IEEE.
[12]. J. Senthilnath, S.N.Omkar, V.Mani,
TejovanthN,P.G . Diwakar, and Archana
Shenoy B,” Hierarchical Clustering Algorithm
for Land Cover Mapping Using Satellite
Images”, IEEE JOURNAL OF SELECTED
TOPICS IN APPLIED EARTH
OBSERVATIONS AND REMOTE
SENSING, VOL. 5, NO. 3, JUNE 2012.
[13]. V. K. Dehariya, S. K. Shrivastava, R. C.
Jain, “Clustering of Image Data Set Using K-

Means and Fuzzy K-Means Algorithms”,
International conference on CICN, pp. 386-
391, 2010.
[14]. K. K. Singh, A. Singh, “A Study of
Image Segmentation Algorithms for Different
Types of Images”, International Journal of
Computer Science Issues, Vol. 7, Issue 5,
2010.
[15]. Nikhil R Pal and Sankar K Pal, A review
on Image Segmentation Techniques, Indian
Statistical Institute, PatternRecognition, Vol
26, No.9, pp.1277, 1993.
[16]. [Pal et. al., 1993] A Review on Image
Segmentation Techniques, Pattern
Recognition Socity, Britain, volume 26, No. 9,
pp. 1274.
[17]. [Fue and Mui, 1981] A survey on image
segmentation, Pattern Recognition 13, 3-16.
[18]. [Haralic and Shaprio, 1985] Survey,
image segmentation techniques, Computer
Vision Graphics Image Process, 29, 100-132.
[19]. [Shaoo et.al., 1988] A survey of
thresholding techniques, Computer Vision
Graphics Image Process, 41, 233-260.
[20]. [Hedley and Yan, 1992] Segmentation of
color images using spatial and color space
information, Journal of Electronic Imaging,
vol. 1, pp. 374-380.
[21]. [Healey et.al., 1992] Segmenting Images
Using Normalized Color, IEEE Transactions
on Systems, Man. and Cybernetics, 22(1): 64-
73.
[22]. [Carron et. al., 1994] Color edge detector
using jointly Hue, Saturation and Intensity, in
Proc. IEEE International Conference on Image
Processing, pp. 977-981.
[23]. [Liu and Yang, 1994] Multiresolution
Color Image Segmentation, IEEE
Transactions on Pattern Analysis and Machine
Intelligence, 16(7): 689-700.
[24]. [Deng and Majunath,1999] Color Image
Segmentation, Proc. IEEE Computer Society
Conference on Computer Vision and Pattern
Recognition, Fort Collins, CO, USA, p.446-51
vol. 2.
[25]. [Dony and Wesolkowski, 1999] Edge
Detection on Color Images Using RGB Vector
Angle, Proceedings of CCECE 1999.



IJRSET NOVEMBER 2015 Volume 2, Issue 12 Pages: 54-62
[26] [Yuan and Oscal, 2009] Image
Segmentation Method Using Thresholds
Automatically Determined from Image
Contents, EURASIP Journal on Image and
Video Processing.
[27]. [Zhiguang et.al., 2008] Unsupervised
Segmentation for Color Image Based on
Graph Theory, IEEE Second International
Symposium on Intelligent Information
Technology Application, 978-0-7695-3497-8.
[28]. [Yi-hua et.al., 2009] A Novel Image
Segmentation Method Based on Random
Walk, IEEE Second Asia- Pacific Conference
on Computational Intelligence and Industrial
Applications, PACIIA, 978-1-4244-4607-
0/09.
[29]. [Yuan and Chen, 2009] Image
Segmentation Method Using Thresholds
Automatically Determined from Image
Contents, EURASIP Journal on Image and
Video Processing Volume 2009, Article ID
140492, 15 pages doi:10.1155/2009/140492.
[30]. [Maia and Hongpeng, 2010] A New
Image Segmentation Method Based on Grey
Graph Cut, IEEE Third International Joint
Conference on Computational Science and
Optimization, 978-0-7695-4030-6/10.
[31]. [Harrabi and Braiek, 2012] Color image
segmentation using multi-level thresholding
approach and data fusion techniques:
application in the breast cancer cells images,
EURASIP Journal on Image and Video
Processing.
[32]. [Rafika and Ezzedine, 2012] Color
image segmentation using multi-level
thresholding approach and data fusion
techniques: application in the breast cancer
cells images, EURASIP Journal on Image and
Video Processing.


